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INTRODUCTION

Breast cancer is a major socio-eco-
nomic problem, because one woman
out of 10 could develop a breast
cancer which is not only a threat for
her life, but also for her appearance
and her femaleness [1].

Recently there are approx. 60 arti-
cles concerning clinical studies
about breast cancer risk and hor-
mone replacement therapy, 1/3 with
increasing risk, 1/3 with no risk
modification and 1/3 with decreas-
ing risk. It has to be noted that the
most recent studies seem to show a
light increase in the risk of detecting
breast cancer in women with hor-
mone replacement therapy (HRT)
[2–6]. Recently two opinions seem
to appear: first the risk might in-
crease with the duration of HRT,
and second the combination of
estrogens and progestagens seems to
be more deleterious than estrogens
alone [2, 7–13]. These studies are
epidemiological studies and no
randomized clinical studies, there-
fore the consideration of biases is of
great importance. The levels of rela-
tive risk (RR) which vary from 1.1 to
1.8 depending on the used HRT-
regimens are not considered as reli-
able by biostatistical specialists. For
them RR-levels of 3 or higher are
reliable.

WHAT COULD DATA TELL US?

For example, a woman with HRT has
a RR of 1.2 to develop a breast can-
cer. Until 5 years of therapy the RR
will not increase. If the HRT is given
for more than 10 years, the RR de-
creases up to 1.6. Some authors,
who are in favour of an RR increase,
try to compare this effect with the
well-known results of the increasing
risk of the duration of ovarian activ-
ity.

However there are two major prob-
lems interpreting these results:
women with HRT cannot be com-
pared with women without HRT,
which has been known for years and
proven by clinical prospective stud-
ies. Women with HRT have regular
checks at their gynaecologist with
breast examination and/or mammog-
raphy. Depending on the study
women with HRT have 15–40 %
more mammographies than women
without HRT. This may explain in
part why breast cancer mortality is
30 % lower in women with HRT at
the time of cancer detection [14–18].

RISK INCREASE AND DURATION
OF THERAPY

In general the risk of detecting breast
cancer is higher between the age of
60 and 65, corresponding to a dura-
tion of 10 to 15 years after meno-
pause, which means 10 to 15 years
of HRT. The potentially higher risk of
developing breast cancer with HRT
will appear 10 to 15 years later and
could be suspended by improved
screening. The effect of treatment
duration and the effect of age will be
intermingled.

COMBINATION THERAPY AND
BREAST CANCER RISK

Concerning this point the publica-
tions are also contradictory, but there
may be a tendency to increasing risk
of breast cancer in women taking a
combination of estrogens/progesta-
gens than taking estrogens alone.
Data for the combination therapy are
not very convincing. Particularly in
the Schairer study [11, 12] only 4 %
of women with breast cancer were
treated with a estrogen/progestagen
therapy, 50 % got no HRT and 46 %

were treated with estrogens alone.
Considering the rare prescription of
progestagens in the USA, one won-
ders why this 4 % of women got a
combination treatment. No recent
study is giving an answer to this
question. Women taking progestins
are those who are at risk of endome-
trial cancer and it is well known that
women with endometrial cancer risk
have also breast cancer risk.

Other, more indirect reasons are
suggested recently to provide the
theory of increased breast cancer risk
under HRT, for example the increase
of mastodynia with estrogen/pro-
gestagen therapy compared with
estrogen alone, as it has been shown
by the PEPI trial. There exists no evi-
dence today that mastodynia in-
duced by HRT is correlated to breast
cancer risk. It has been considered
that the density of mammary tissue is
more increasing under combination
therapy than with estrogen alone and
even more without treatment. But
there is also no evidence that in-
creased mammographic density with
HRT is correlated to higher breast
cancer risk. In the PEPI trial this in-
crease disappeared after one year of
treatment.

However the anxiety of breast cancer
in the general population and in
some colleagues has to be consid-
ered: the prescription of HRT to
women who are afraid of breast can-
cer should be avoided, because of
lacking compliance.

TIBOLONE

This particular substance does not
induce any increase in mastodynia
or mammographic density. In experi-
mental studies a decrease of estrogen
synthesis in mammary tissue could
be shown which is an important
observation because all estrogens in
breast tissue are not from circulating
estrogens, but from in situ-synthesis.
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Tibolone acts against the formation
of estrone-sulphate into estrone and
of estrone into estradiol. It also pro-
motes the conversion of estradiol
into estrone and estradiol-sulphate.
Thus it is likely to have an anti-
estrogenic effect by acting in the
synthesis at the mammary level. In
experimental models tibolone is as-
sociated with decrease of carcino-
genesis inducted by DMPA at the
breast level and with an deceleration
effect of tumour growth in pre-exist-
ing tumours. An increase of breast
cell apoptosis has also been ob-
served. Although the current data in
this field are very promising [19–23]
more research is still needed.

RALOXIFEN

Like tamoxifen, raloxifen belongs to
the SERM (selective estrogen receptor
modulators) family. In a large random-
ised placebo-controlled study over
4 years (MORE trial) evaluating the
effects of raloxifen on bone there
could be reported a decreasing risk
of breast cancer of almost 90 % in
the treated women compared to
those with placebo. This results in
conjunction with good preventive
results of tamoxifen has lead to state-
ments that raloxifen could represent
a treatment of osteoporosis risk in
association with breast cancer pre-
vention. This statements has to be
regarded with caution because the
duration of the study was not long
enough and the substance can not be
associated with inhibition of carcino-
genesis, but with deceleration of pre-
existing cancers’ growth. Further-
more only differentiated forms
(estrogen-receptor positive, ER+) are
diminished, whereas the incidence
of ER– breast cancers is not modified
by treatment with raloxifen. The
question is whether raloxifen simply
slows down the development of
estrogen-dependent clones without
modifying the final incidence or
prognosis of these cancers. Raloxifen
could be prescribed for women with

breast cancer risk, but without safety
evidence [24].

PHYTOESTROGENES

In epidemiological trials it has been
shown that life-long consumption of
phytoestrogens is associated with a
decreased risk of breast cancer de-
tection, but it is just an association
and not a causality factor. The in-
creased consumption of phytoestro-
gens goes along with fewer saturated
fatty acids consumption, which is
considered to be correlated to breast
cancer risk. It is thus impossible to
decide if it is the increase of phyto-
estrogen-consumption or the de-
crease of fat consumption which is
responsible for this decrease of
breast cancer incidence, if there is a
relationship between one of these
factors and the disease. And nobody
knows at which age and which dura-
tion – if any effect exists – it has to
be looked for. Today phytoestrogens
are prescribed to women, who are
afraid of HRT because of breast can-
cer risk or because of a pre-existing
breast cancer, but this is not based
on any clinical study.

CONCLUSION

Thus the three substances – tibolone,
raloxifen and phytoestrogens – are
interesting for the treatment of some
menopause symptoms for women
with breast cancer risk or particularly
afraid of breast cancer. As for now
these are only theoretical hypothesis
which have to be supported by long-
term and difficult to obtaining stud-
ies [25, 26]. Finally it is important to
mention that neither tibolone nor
raloxifen should be used in women
with breast cancer history.
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